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Entity Name: Health Access of California 

Submitted 6y: Tam Ma 
Date Submitted: 5/20/2016 11:00:23 AM 

Status: i Pending @......•. 
Date of Decision: .el 
OMHC Comment: (8000 .. characters rernaining) 

Updated By: 
Updated Date: 

Oecislons & Comment History (!·fide O&!a/ls . .J 

There are currently no decisions or comment history. 

Award Application (Hide Details . ._) 

-Printer Format 

t. For whict, proceeding are you seeking compensation? 

Proposed merger of Centene and Hea Ith Net 

2. What is the amount requested? 

$17,390.00 

3. Proceeding Contribution: 

Provide a description of the ways in which your involvement made a substantial contribution to the 
proceeding as defined in California Code of Regulations, Title 28, Section 1010(b)(14), supported by 
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specific citat ions to the recorcl, your testimony, cross-exa m ination ,  arguments, briefs, letters ,  motions, 
discovery , or  any other app ropriate ev idence.  

(SOOO characters remaln ing)  

Heal th  Access  Ca l ifornia submits th is request for reaso n a b l e  advocacy fees for our  
! sub st,mtia l  contribution to the Depa rtment of  Ma naged Health Care's ( DMHC) decision

regard i ng Centene Corporation 's acq u isition of Hea lth Net, Inc. H ea l th Access substantia l ly
contributed to DMHC's rev iew of the proposed merger as  follows: On December 7, 2 0 1 5 ,
T.i m Mil,  Hea l th Access' Policy Cou nsel ,  prov ided ora l testimony a t  the Department's
pub l ic meeting  where she h igh l ighted concerns a bout Health Net's track record in  ab i d i ng
by  consu mer protections as  we l l  as the  i m pact the  merger would have on consu mers. Ms.
Ma spec i fica l ly  h igh l ig hted Hea lth Net's deficienc ies in  I ts Rout ine Med ica l Su rvey , 
numerous enforcement actions, and low q ua l i ty ratings for customer sat i sfacti on,
prevention , and treatment .  She  a lso raised concerns about Centene 's track record In other 
states , pa rticu lar ly in Kentucky where it abruptly w i thdrew from the sta te's Med i ca id
market mid-contract , d i srupt ing  coverage and care for patients th ere.  Hea l th  Access a lso
col la bora ted w ith Consumers U n ion and Western Center on  Law and  Poverty to s ubmit  a 
l i st of quest i ons that DMHC shou ld cons ider  and  inquire of Centene <1 nd Hea l th Net . 
Fina lly ,  we submitted exte ns ive written comments on the proposed merger, and out l ined 
how insure r  conso l idat ion affects on-going imp lementation of the Affordable Care Act , 
deta i led research a bo u t  me rgers lead ing  to h igher  prices for consumers, a nd how l1 ea lth
care costs cont inue  to be a major concern for consumers. We a l so ra ised  concerns a bout
Centene 's rapid expans ion  in  the Med i c a i d  ma rket and its lack  of experience in  the
commercia l market, particu la r ly in  Cal iforn ia . The letter a lso deta i l ed concerns  about
Health Net's fa l l u re to  a bide by  consumer protect ions  and provided a number of
recommendations  for quest i ons and cond itions  that shou ld be im posed shou ld the merger 
be approved . M a n y  of our  suggest i ons were reflected in the DMHC's approva l and
assoc ia ted  underta kings ,  inc ludi ng the requ irements to mainta i n Hea l th Net's
headquarters and key fu nctions and operata ions i n Ga l iforn ia ,  correct deficienc ies at  DMHC
and DHCS, Improve the a ccuracy and  rel iab i l i ty of provider d i rectories, improve qua l ity
and consumer  satisfaction ratings ,  and support consumer assistance programs and  the
hea lth care I nfrastructure for underserved communit ies,  particu larl y i n  rural a reas. The 
undertak ings  a lso address concern s we ra i sed rega rding  ensuring that health care costs , 
pa rti cu la rly arou nd u n reasonab le  rate increases and  ensuring that  executive compensation 
and  costs assoc iated with the  merger n ot be born by consumers .  The underta kings 
;idd ress concerns we raised about whether Centene  wou ld mainta in  a presence i n
Ca l i fornia's commercia l  market and  how i t  wou ld ga in  prof ic iency in  the commerc ia l
market . Our  invo lvement resu l ted in  more re levant ,  cred ib le,  and  non-fnvi lous i nformat ion
be ing ava i lab le to  the D i rector . In  add i t ion  to  prov id ing  ora l  testimony at  the December 7 ,
20 1 5  pub l i c  meet i ng ,  we submitted the Fol l owing letters : - Jo int Letter - Quest ions  for 
Centene and Hea lth Net ( December 14 ,  2014)- Health Access Com m e nts - Centene­
Health Net Merger ( D ecember 14 , 20 1 5) 

4. Please attach you r  t ime and b i ll ing record in the "Add Attachment" box below . !n the t ime and l:>il l l ng 
record, include the 11ou11y rate of compensation for each witness or aelvocate a 11d a Justi ri catlon for each
hourly rate, which may incl ude copies ot or citations to previously approved hourly rate ; and each witness
or  advocate 's resu me or  cur r i culum v i tae. The time and bil l ing record should show the date and exact
a mount o f  ti me  spent on each speci fic task In th irty (30)  m inute in crements, as defined In Ca l i forn ia  Code
of Regu la t i ons , Title 22, Sectlon 1 0 1 0 ( d ) ( 3 ) .

Document N a me Date U ploaded Uploaded By

Hea lth Access Time
Records

5/20/2016  1 0 : 5 9 : 26 AM Tam Ma View

 Hea l th Access B IOS and
Bi l l i ng C l ass ifications  

5/20/2016 10 : 59 :43  AM Ta m Ma View

5. Clear and concise statement of partici pants i nterest i n  the proceeding which explains why participation is
needed to represent the Interests of consumers 

-
As the statew i de health ca re consumer advocacy coal iti on, Hea l th Access has  had a 
longstand ing com mitment to protecti ng consumer in terests and ensu ring hea l th p la ns 
comply  w ith the consu mer protections provided by the Knox-Keene Act. We have been 
active in  ra isi ng  cons u m e r  concerns In hea lth industry transacti ons, i nclud ing hea l th  p l an 
mergers.  Hea l  h Access has experience a nd expert ise i n  the laws and reg u lat ions a ffect i ng  
ma naged care .  Ou r pa rticipation i s  necessa ry to  ensu re t h a t  consu mers, pa rticu l a rly  
enrol lees of  Health Net,  are represented in  th is  tra n sact ion . Our ora l  a nd wr i tten 
comments provides the De partment w ith informati on regard ing how hea lth  plan mergers 
affect com petit ion and prem i u m s .  We a lso prov ide ana lysis of how hea l th plan  mergers 
should be reviewed i n  the context of Ca l i forn ia ' s imp lementat ion of the Afforda b le  Care 
Act and  deta i l  Health N et's extens ive track record of not  a b id i ng by basic cons umer 
protections. In add ition , we h igh light  Centene's act iv i ty i n  other  states a nd rai se concerns  
about their lack of exper ience in  Ca l i forn i a ' s commercia l  market. We be l ieve our  
part iclpa tion prov ides in formed ins ight  and ensures that the i n terests of hea  Ith care 
consumers are represented and cons idered d u ring  the Department 's rev iew of  th is  I

tran saction . i
__ _ _j

6. 
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The information contained in the Petition to Participate remains true and correct to the best of the 
knowledge of the person verifying the Information. 

Yes 
,----------- ·- - " 

------------ =i

I am authorized to certify this document on behalf of the applicant. By entering my name below, r certify 
under penalty of perjury under the laws or the State of California that the foregoing statements within all 
documents filed electronically are true and correct and that this declaration was executed at 

Saq;amento (City), _.IA. (State), on May 20. 2016 

Enter Name: Tam Ma 

Account Info at Time of 
Submission (Hide Details .. ) 

Account Information 

Health Access of Callfornic1 

Organization 

tma@health•access.org 

(916) 497 · 0923 ext. 201 

1127 · 11th Street 

234 

Sacramento 

CA 

Organization Legal Name: 

Organization Fictitious 

Name: Accc>unt Type: 

Email Address: 

Organization Phone Number: 

Physical Address 

Physical Address: 

Suite: 

City: 

State: 

Zip/Postal Code: 95814 

Or·ganization Information 

Organization Name: Health Access California 

Is this a nonprofit organization?: Yes 

Under what Statute Is your Nonprofit Public Benefit Corporation Law for public and 
on;ianizatlon Incorporated?: charitable purposes 

Organization's Siie: $125,000.00 

Organization's Structure: 501 c4 

Description of the Organization's HEALTH ACCESS CALIFORNIA iS trie 
General Purposes: statewide health care consumer advocacy 

coalition, advocating for the goal of quality, 
affordable health care for all Californians. 

Organization"s Governing Body 

1. Director Aaron Fox 

2. Director Art Pulaski 

3. Director Betsy lmholz 

4. Director Cary Sanders 

5. Director Christina Livingston 

6. Director Emily Rusch 

7. Director Henry l.acayo 

a. Director Horace Willfams 

9. Director Joan Pirkle Smith 

10. Director Jon Youngdahl 

http:// otis/apps/cpp/ awaTd _ awardList. aspx?aKey=48&awKey=69&main Tab=:::4 7/7/2016 
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11. Director Joshua Pechthalt 

12. Director Kathy Ko Chin 

!3. Director Lori Easterling 

14. Director Nancy Brasmer 

15. Director Paul Knepprath 

16. Director Reshma Shamasundra 

17. Director Rick Schlosser 

18. Director Roma Guy 

19. Director Sonya Young 

20. Director Stewart ferry 

21. Director Ted Lempert 

22. Director Thomas Saenz 

23. Director Vanessa Aramayo 

24. Director Willie Pelote 

Organization's Officers 

1. Executive Director Anthony Wright 

Contact Info at Time ot 

Submission (Hide Details .. ; 

First Name: Tam 

Last Name: Ma 

Email Address: tma@health·access.org 

Telephone Number: (916) 497 • 0923 ext. 201 

Status: Ac tive 

'.:i Jose Tapia 

':i SIivia Flores 

°:!Tam Ma 
.,. ., Rick Pavich 

� Robin Avant 

!_ __________________________________________ _ 

'-------------------------------------------

http://otis/apps/cpp/award_awardList.aspx?aKey=48&awKey=69&mainTab=4 7/7/2016 



Health Access California 

Time Records - Centene-Health Net Merger 

A B C 

1 Tam Ma, Policy Counsel 

Time 
Date Work Performed 

2 Spent 

- '.) 
.. 

10/6L2.Ql5 Submit PRA request for filings. 0.5 

4--- -10119/201"5 Received email from DMHC re: PRA request - 0.5 
- ·•-· . -·-·· ----------------------------------+-----+-5 ."10/27./20-15 Exchange emails with DMHC re: PRA request 0.5 -

6 10/28/2015 Review Centene-Health Net filings 1.5 
-- -------------- ------------

-
-

-
111312015 Watch videos from UCLA panel entitled, "ls Merger Mania 

1 
7 Healthy?"

----·------.-
8 11/10/2015 Email with Consumers Union re: mergers 0.5 

-9-- ----1"1 /16120-1 a Reviewed DMHC notice of public meeting - 0.5 
··--

11/19/2015 Exchange emails with CA Primary Care Assn re: mergers 
0.5 

10 review process 

11/19/2015 Exchange emails with Consumers Union re: DMHC public 
0.5 

11 meeting 
·-·-

D E 

Hourly 
Total 

Rate 

$250 $125 

$250 $125 -------!----
$250 $125 

$250 $375 

$250 $250 

$250 $125 

$250 $125 

$250 $125 

$250 $125 
.. --· - -

11/19/2015 Review Catteano & Stroud report on results of the proposed 
0.5 

12 California HMO acquisitions. 
$250 $125 

·-----·--- -

13 11/24/2015 Exchange emails with Consumers Union re: research 0.5 $250 $125 

12/3/2015 DMHC Consumer Advocates Meeting: discussion re: merger 
0.5 $250 $125 

14 

15 0.5 $250 $125 

16 0.5 
--

$350 $175 

3.5 
17 

$250 $875 

3 
18 

$250 $750 

12/3/2015 Email with Consumers Union re: research 

12/3/2015 DMHC Consumer Advocates Mee!!_ngr discussion re: merger 
12/3/2015 Research & review: DMHC rate revew, routine medical 

surveys, enforcement actions, lMR. grievances and 

12/4/2015 Research & review: OPA HMO report cards, complaint data; 
Quality ratings; 

-- -
CoveredCA enrollment & regions 

. 

12/5/2015 Research: Centene activities in other states; review articles 2.5 
19 and research re: impact of insurer mergers on consumers. $250 $625 

--- ---

20 12/6/2015 Draft testimony for public meeting 2.5 $250 $625 

21 12/7/2015 Edit and revise testimony for public meeting 0.5 
--- - $250 $125 ------1---

22 12/7/2015 Attend and testify public meeting 2 
- -- $250 $500 

-- ---

Meet with Consumers Union re: next steps 23 12/7/2015 0.5 $250 $125 

1 



Health Access California 

Time Records - Centene-Health Net Merger 

A B C D E 

12/8/2015 Research Centene enrollment and revenues; Research 
general enrollment in individual and group markets; health 2 $250 $500 

24 care costs and cost-sharing; 

25 12/8/2015 Brainstorm potential undertakings to recommend 0.5 $250 $125 

26 12/9/2015 Emails with Planned Parenthood re: consumer concerns 0.5 $250 $125 

27 

28 

29 

. 12/11/2015 Emails with Consumers Union and Western Center on Law 
0.5 $250 

and Poverty re: Joint Letter 

12/12/2015 Health Access email discussion re: Joint Letter 0.5 $250 

12/12/2015 Draft Health Access comment letter 5.5 $250 

I 

I 

$125 

$125 

$1,375 

30 

31 

12/13/2015 Draft/edit Joint Letter from Health Access, Consumers Union, 
1.5 $250 

Western Center on Law and Poverty 

12/14/2015 Health Access email discussion re: comment letter 0.5 $250 

$375 

$125 

32 

33 

34-·-

12/14/2015 Revise comment letter and format for submission 2 $250 

1/27/2016 Read and send news article re: Centene data breach to 
0.5 $250 

DMHC 

-31-2-2/-2<:H 6 _CalLwitl+-DMHG-re:-approval of- merger,;--review·tindertakings 1 $250 

$500 

$125 

$250 

35 

36 TOTAL 38 $9,550 

37 

38 Anthony Wright, Executive Director 

39 

40 

41 

Time Hourly 
Date Work Performed Total 

Spent Rate 

10/24/2015 Research HealthNet-Centene and merger issues 1 $350 $350 
------ - -------------------------------+----+-------+-----
10/25/2015 Draft outline of consumer issues on mergers 1.5 $350 $525 

42 

43 

10/26/2015 Survey on how HealthNet relates to other mergers. 0.5 $350 

10/27/2015 Review HealthNetCentene filings 1 $350 

$175 I 

$350 

Participate/discuss merger at UCLA panel entitled, "Is Merger 
Mania Healthy?", post-panel conversations on consumer 

44 

45 

10/28/2015 principles 2.5 $350 $875 

11/9/2015 Conversation with Consumers Union, CALPIRG re: mergers -- 0.5 ___ $350 , __ $175 

-46

47

48

11/16/2015 Reviewed/discussed DMHC notice of public meeting 0.5 $350 $175 

11/18/2015 E-mail/call with CPCA on merger 0.5 $350 $175 

11/25/2015 Exchange emails with staff and allies on merger research 0.5 $350 $175 

2 



Health Access California 

Time Records - Centene-Health Net Merger 

A B C D E 

49 12/3/2015 DMHC Consumer Advocates Meeting: discussion re: merger I 0.5 $350 I $175 

so 12/3/2015 Research on past conditions/undertakings 1 $350 $350 
---· 

Assist on policy direction of HealthNet-Centene research and 
51 12/4/2015 comments 0.5 $350 -----1-------------------------!.---!·-- ---- $175 

52 12/6/2015 Review and edit Policy Counsel's testimony for public meeting 1 $350 $350 

53 

54 

12/7/2015 Attend and testify public meeting 2 $350 

12/7/2015 Meet with Consumers Union 0.5 $350 -
$700 

$175 

55 12/8/2015 Brainstorm potential conditions/undertakings 1 $350 $350 
-----

Emails with Consumers Union and Western Center on Law 
---

56 12/11/2015 and Poverty re: Joint Letter 0.5 $350 $175 

57 12/12/2015 Health Access email discussion re: Joint Letter 0.5 $350 $175 

Review/edit Joint Letter from Health Access, Consumers 
58 12/13/2015 Union, Western Center on Law and Poverty 0.5 $350 $175 

59 12/14/2015 Health Access email discussion re: comment letter 0.5 $350 --------- $175 

60 12/14/2015 Review and edit comment letter 1.5 $350 $525 

61 2/18/2016 Discussion with HealthNet CEO Jay Gellert ,_ 0.5 $350 $175 

Review/react/analyze DMHC conditions to HealthneUCentene 
62 

63 

- · -3/2212{)1·6 deal 1 $350 

------
$350 

64 

-

TOTAL 20 '----
$7,000 

65 

-

______ ,_ -- ·- ---
66 

-- ···-· 

Beth Capell, Policy Advocate 

67 

68 

69 

Time Hourly 
Date Work Performed 

Spent Rate 

12/7/2015 review draft of public testimony 0.5 $420 

12/13/2015 review/edit joint letter with CU, WCLP 0.5 $420 -----

--·-

Total 

$210 

$210 

70 

71 

---- -

12/14/2015 review and edit Health Access comment letter 0.5 $420 

12/14/2015 discussion of comment letter 0.5 $420 
.. ~ - ----+-----

$210 

$210 

72 
-

73 TOTAL 2 $840 

3 
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BETH CAPELL, PH.D., Capell & Assoc. has been the principal and owner of Capell & Assoc.since its 
founding in 1995. She has thirty-eight years of experience in Sacramento, working in the Legislature, 
various Administrations, and with various interest groups. 

Beth Capell provides policy analysis, legislative advocacy, and other strategic input to Health Access and 
to other consumer, labor and public interest organizations on health care issues. 

Health Access California sponsored the package of legislation known as the HMO Patient Bill of Rights 
from 1995 to its enactment in 1999. Health Access Foundation led a collaborative of consumer groups 
that monitored initial implementation of the more than 20 pieces of legislation enacted between 1995 and 
2000 intended to protect consumers from HMOs. Health Access Foundation has continued to work on 
implementation and ongoing monitoring of the law with respect to consumer protections against HMOs. 
Beth Capell has been an architect and active advocate throughout the two decades of these efforts. 

Beth Capell has worked on issues including prescription drugs, universal access, hospital overcharging, 
balance billing by physicians, nursing home regulations, hospital standards, health insurance regulation, 
and other health care issues. 

Prior to establishing Capell & Assoc. Beth Capell represented the California Nurses Association from 
1986 to 1995, first as the legislative advocate and later as the Director of Government Relations for the 
association. From 1983 to 1986, Ms. Capell worked at the California Manufacturers Association, working 
on job training and human resource issues, including health insurance. From 1977 to 1983, Ms. Capell 
worked in various positions in the Legislature, the Administration, and other efforts. 

Ms. Capell has Ph.D. in political science from the University of California, Berkeley, and continues to 
publish articles and present papers on political science, specifically interest groups, legislatures, and the 
impact of legislative term limits. 

Billing classification: Experts: 13+ years of experience. $420/hour. 

ANTHONY WRIGHT serves as Executive Director for Health Access California, the statewide health care 
consumer advocacy coalition, working on behalf of the insured and uninsured, made up of over 200 
organizations representing seniors, children, working families, people with disabilities, immigrants, people 
of faith, labor, and communities of color. 

Under Wright's leadership since 2002, Health Access has been a leader in efforts to fight health care 
budget cuts, to expand both employer-based coverage and public insurance programs, to advance 
consumer protections, and to address the causes of medical debt. For example, his work on hospital 
overcharging and abusive billing and collections practices led to both to legislative action and hospital 
guidelines on the issue. Recently, he served as co-chair and campaign manager for the No on 78/Yes on 
79 initiative effort, facing the prescription drug industry and the most expensive ballot campaign in the 
nation's history. 

Wright's background is as a consumer advocate and community organizer, and he has been widely 
quoted in local and national media on a range of issues. He served as Program Director for New Jersey 
Citizen Action. As coordinator of New Jersey's health care consumer coalition, he ran successful 
campaigns to win HMO patient protections, defeat for-profit takeovers of nonprofit hospitals and Blue 
Cross Blue Shield, pass a law to govern hospital conversions and acquisitions, and expand coverage for 
low- and moderate-income children and parents. 

Wright also worked at the Center for Media Education in Washington, DC, The Nation magazine in New 
York, and in Vice President Gore's office in the White House. Born and raised in the Bronx, Wright 
graduated from Amherst College magna cum laude in both English and Sociology. 

Billing classification: Experts: 13+ years of experience. $350/hour. 



Tam M. Ma is Policy Counsel at Health Access California, where she represents health care consumers 
in the Legislature and before administrative and regulatory entities. Tam has over thirteen years' 
experience crafting state public policy. She started her career as a California Senate Fellow and was 
previously senior staff to Senators Mark Leno and Sheila Kuehl, where she advised the Senators on 
policy and state budget issues relating to health and human services, consumer protection, housing, 
judiciary, and women's issues. 

Tam has crafted and worked for passage of legislation to protect consumers from unfair out-of-pocket 
costs, increase transparency in health care premiums, streamline state public benefits programs, help 
people living with HIV/AIDS to transition between new forms of health coverage under the Affordable 
Care Act, enhance consumer awareness of toxic flame retardant chemicals in home furnishings, 
strengthen the rights of low-income tenants, and increase protections for survivors of domestic violence, 
sexual assault, and human trafficking. 

Tam was honored by the California Partnership to End Domestic Violence and the California Coalition 
Against Sexual Assault for her work to strengthen protections for survivors of these crimes. Tam 
advocated for the rights of low-income tenants when she was a trial attorney with Legal Services of 
Northern California's Sargent Shriver Civil Counsel Act project. 

Tam sits on the board of the Women's Foundation of California and has served as a trainer and mentor 
for the foundation's award-winning Women's Policy Institute since its inception in 2003. She also serves 
on the board of the Asian/Pacific Bar Association of Sacramento and is Past President of My Sister's 
House, a domestic violence shelter serving women throughout the Central Valley. Tam received her B.A. 
(2002) and J.D. (2011) from the University of California, Berkeley, and has served as a lecturer at the law 
school. 

Billing classification: Attorney: 3-4 years of experience. $250/hour. 




